
 

PRAYER FOR THE SICK:   

Please pray for all in the parish who are seriously ill.  

 

RECENTLY DECEASED:   

Lucy Fenton. 

 

MONTH’S MIND: 

Phyllis Lyons, Bartly Donohoe. 

 

ANNIVERSARIES: 

Tony Sheils, Aine O’Molloy,  

Mairead Condra, Pearl Farrell. 

Maureen Doyle 

 

PLEASE SEE CHURCH NOTICE BOARD ……………….. 

Open Evening—Margaret Ayward Community College, Tuesday 18th 

September from 4.00 p.m. to 6.00 p.m. 

Culture Night 2018—God is in the House. 

24th  Sunday in Ordinary time  - 16th Sept. ‘18 

Mass Times 

Saturday: 

10.00 a.m. &  5.30 p.m. (Vigil)                    

Sunday:   

9.30 a.m., 11.00 a.m., 12.30 p.m.  

Weekdays:  

8.00 a.m. & 10.00 a.m. (Monday 

to Friday) 

Eve of Holy Days:  

7.30. p.m. (Vigil) 

Working Holy Days:  

8.00 a.m., 10.00 a.m., 11.00 a.m.  

St. Patrick’s Day:                    

As Sunday 

Bank Holidays:   

10.00 a.m. (Church  closes at 

11.00 a.m.) 

Confessions: 

Saturday: 

10.30 a.m. - 11.00 a.m. & 5.00 

p.m. - 5.30 p.m. 

Thursday - Eve of First Fri-

days:                         

After 10.00 a. m. Mass 

Baptisms:                 

1st  & 3rd Saturday of each 

month - 12.00 noon  

Church of St. Vincent De Paul, Marino, D09 KN83 
 

V. Rev. Tom Noone, Parish Priest:    Tel. 8332864 

Parish Office:                Tel/Fax. 8332772  

E-mail:  info@marinoparish.ie                           

Website: www.marinoparish.ie    

Twitter:   @marinoparish 

Sunday Thought  

Our times have an air of instability and 

everyone feels the sense of upheaval and 

unpredictability. Fear is perfectly under-

standable. Something similar may be 

said of our lives as believers. From a 

“church” point of view, we wonder who 

will be in church in the coming years and 

who will preside at the Mass. And yet, at 

the centre of the faith project stands not 

my condition or even my faith, but all 

that God did for us in Jesus’ death and 

resurrection. As St. Paul exclaims “who 

can separate us from the love of God in 

Christ”?  

 

Prayer: I love you, Lord, my rock, my for-

tress, my refuge. Help me to take hold of 

the hand you stretch out in Jesus. 

Hymns:   

Entrance        Hymn 35,    Page 16 

Recessional   Hymn   4,        Page 6  

mailto:info@marinoparish.ie
http://www.marinoparish.ie


Crosscare Social Support Agency of 
the Catholic Archdiocese of Dublin.  
The annual collection for Communi-
ty & Homeless Services will be held 
at all masses this weekend and will 
replace the usual Share collection.       

                                 

Volunteer Garda e-vetting : It is in-
tended to use the Volunteer Regis-
ter from October onwards to vali-
date Volunteers in their roles. This 
process started in April of this year 
and while we have made considera-
ble progress in getting a lot 
of  volunteers to complete the 
Vetting we are still missing some 
people. If you have yet to complete 
a Volunteer Vetting form please col-
lect one as soon as possible from 
the Sacristy or Parish Office. Please 
note that Vetting is specific to each 
organisation. You may have already 
completed vetting with another or-
ganisation e.g. GAA but that Vetting 
cannot be transferred to this organ-
isation. 

 

Eucharistic Adoration takes place 
every Monday in our Parish Church 
from 3.00 p.m. to 4.00 p.m.  All 
Welcome. 

 

 

CONFIRMATION: INFORMATION 
EVENING FOR PARENTS  - Now that 
the school year has started, it's time 
to kick off our Parish Programme 
for Confirmation. To this end, there 
will be an INFORMATION EVENING 
for parents of all those making Con-
firmation in the Spring of 2019, on 
Tues 25th September at 7.30 pm in 
the church.  Looking forward to see-
ing you all there, Anne Dooley, Par-
ish Catechist. 

 

Tea/Coffee Mornings have re-

sumed and will continue every 

Tuesday, Wednesday and Thursday 

morning after the 10.00 a.m. Mass  

New members most welcome. 

 

Schools for Syria—Fr. William Stu-

art wishes to acknowledge the kind-

ness of the people of Marino in giv-

ing €5,095 towards Schools for Syria 

“I am totally overwhelmed by your 

generosity. I promise to spend it 

well and carefully in my work with 

refugees in Tyre, Lebanon. With 

prayers and affection, yours (Fr.) 

William Stuart” 

 

Eucharist Adoration  has resumed 
in the Oratory of the Rosminian Fa-
thers, Clonturk House and will con-
tinue each Sunday night  (except 
Bank Holiday Weekends) from 7.00 
p.m. to 8.00 p.m.  

 

The scripture based contemplative 
prayer group will resume its 
meetings  in the Oratory, Clonturk 
House, Church Avenue from next 
Tuesday 18th September and will 
continue each Tuesday for 1 hour, 
beginning at 8.00 pm.  

 

Church Repository/Shop:                 
The Church Repository/Shop is 
open every Tuesday and Thursday 
morning after 10.00 a.m. Mass and 
after 11.00 a.m. Mass on Sundays. 
We have a good supply of sacra-
mental mementos for boys and girls  
for all special occasions.  

 
 

 

Signed Mass Cards are also availa-
ble  from the Parish shop as well as 
the Sacristy. 

 

Annual Solemn Novena to our 
Lady of Perpetual Help at St Al-
phonsus Monastery  Monday 17th 
– Tuesday 25th September at the 
Monastery of St Alphonsus, St Al-
phonsus’ Road Upper, Dublin D09 
HN53.                                                          
Mass Times: 9.30am and 
8pm.                                                   
Redemptorist Preacher: Fr Tim 
Buckley, C.Ss.R. 

   

 Our Scripture Reflection Group 
have resumed their meetings on 
Thursday mornings at 11.00 am in 
the Annadale. New members wel-
come. 

       

Parish Lotto: 

There was no winner of the Parish Lotto this 
week.  

The winning numbers were:   1, 2, 12, 17 

The jackpot now stands at €4,500 


